Hargana Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana

No. 119-2020/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, MONDAY, AUGUST 24, 2020 (BHADRA 2,1942 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 24th August, 2020

No. 21-HLA of 2020/65/11504.— The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Bill, 2020, is hereby
published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and
Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :—

Bill No. 21-HLA of 2020

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT
BILL, 2020

A
BILL

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-first Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—
1. (1)  This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2020.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016.

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,-
@) in sub-section (1), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be
substituted; and
(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be
substituted.

(1699)

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 4 of
Haryana Act 14 of
2016.



1700 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 24, 2020 (BHDR. 2, 1942 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

1. The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special
Provision) Act 2016 was enacted to identify those areas falling within Municipal Limits where construction
has taken place on more than fifty percent plots prior to 31st March 2015 to declare such areas as the Civic
Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas to provide Civic Amenities and Infrastructure in such
Areas. In this Act under section 4 “Enforcement to be kept in Abeyance” was for a period of one year which
was upto 20.04.2017. The department took following action within the validity period of one year.

a. Issued guidelines to seek proposal from municipalities vide letter dated 10.7.2015

b. Circulated the procedure vide memo dated 16.09.2016, 18.11.2016 and 26.12.2016 (which were kept on
hold vide memo dated 08.08.2017).

c. Issued Development Charges vide order dated 04.10.2016. (which were kept on hold vide memo dated
21.10.2016).

2. Since, action regarding declaration of unauthorized colonies could not be completed within one year, therefore
further an amendment in the Act was brought extending the time limits from “one year” to “two years” vide
notification dated 23.11.2017.the said Act was valid till 20.04.2018.

a. Thereafter proposals received from various municipalities were examined. Out of the proposal of total
982 colonies of 80 municipalities, 528 colonies were found eligible.

b. 15 colonies of MC, Gurugram and 9 colonies of MC Faridabad were notified vide notification dated
06.12.2017 under the Act.
3. In the meanwhile action regarding declaration of unauthorized colonies could not be completed within two

years, therefore another amendment in the Act was brought extending the time limits from “two year” to “three
years” vide notification dated 19.04.2018. As per the said amendment, the Act is valid till 20.04.2019:-

a. Thereafter 17 colonies of Municipal corporation Gurugram and Faridabad, 343 colonies of other
Municipal Corporations, 106 colonies of Municipal Councils and 181 colonies of Municipal
Committees have been notified till date

b. Development Charges have been issued vide order dated 27.09.2018.

4. The amendment to extend validity of the said Act for four years i.e. from 21.04.2016 to 20.04.2020, was
submitted by the Department to the Government and the same was also got approved by Vidhan Sabha, but the
same could not get notified.

5. During the period of 21.04.2019 to 20.04.2020, the Department notified 15 colonies vide notifications dated
18.06.2019, 10.09.2019, 17.01.2020 and also issued various instructions. Since, the amendment could not get
notified, therefore it is required to extend the validity of the Act.

6. Further, at present there are about 15 of colonies for which revised proposal from MCs have been received,
which are yet to be notified under the said Act, for which the validity of the said Act is required to be
extended.

7. All actions pertaining to declaration of colonies is to be completed within the validity period, but considering

that some colonies are yet to be notified which is likely to take time more than the valid period specified in the
Act,hence, it is required to extend the period stated in the section 4 of the Act for completion of the process. It
is, therefore, proposed that in section 4 (1) and (2) of the Act the words “three years” may be substituted by the
words “five years” so that two more years may be made available to declare areas as the Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas.

ANIL VIJ,
Urban Local Bodies Minister, Haryana.

Chandigarh: R. K. NANDAL,
The 24th August, 2020. Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 24, 2020 (BHDR. 2, 1942 SAKA) 1701

[T STgars]
2020 FT fAS9® =T 21 TATAT.
R TIRuTferaT &3 § el ArTRe ga—gfaursi qer
AT BT e (fady Suew) Heed faerd, 2020
R TIRuTferaT &3 # arqel ArTRe ga—gfaursi qer
JTERTT BT yeee (fady Suaw) i, 2016,

B AN GIRT o & forg
IGERET

YR TIRST & ghecRd 98 § sRIon =g femaved gr1 fR=falRed wu & a8 sfafafag
q -

1. (1) I JfRfrm sRawn TRufesdr sl A squl ANRE  gu—fdurell dqor W T der
TR BT Taed (A Sugeer) Hene ¥, 2020, BT S AHT § | TR |

(2)  TT 21 37U, 2016 | AL T3 FHAST SIQI |
2. BRAvm TROferer & # Il ARG JE—GfAurell qel SawRed bl yege 2016 T gRamw

(faery Sug=) M, 2016 @) €T 4 H— mmﬁ
() Su—urT (1) # D 99 e B WE W, Cufg 99 vreq gfoRenfud few s
SITQ ;eI

(i) SU-gRT (2) # “IF I’ R B WE W, ‘U IY° T yferenfua fey
ST |



1702

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 24, 2020 (BHDR. 2, 1942 SAKA)

IR Td SR BT fJaRor
BRATOT TRUTTRT Yol &= H ANTRE E—giaemeli q;T JaaT &1 e (e Sudw) e
2016 UTferpT AMRIT § TS dTel I &3l dl ygar & ford AffFIHa fBar war o S8l 31.3.2015 A
qd 50 GRrerd el uR T f6ar S gt § Bl ARG Grg—JiAumsi T SfaddT e aRA b o
S &3 BT ARG E—JAT T JTHEAT Y0 TRUTSTHT &3 |iivd fHar S € | 59 s

P URT 4 ‘Yad= SRAMT IGAT T 99 P 31afS & forw off, ST 20.04.2017 I 2 | 39 fA9TT gRT U
Tl BT dgdT & vl § =forRad &ard f5y T

. TRUTIBRI H U UTd )1 & folv o fadid 10.7.2015 gRT feen—fAder vy fhy v

W 39 Ufhar & AU A 16.09.2016,18.11.2016 TAT 26.12.2016 RT URATferd fhar ar (g w
SO faTid 08.08.2017 ERT b T T TE) |

T ARy AP 04.10.2016 R fAbMN Yob IR By Y, (R R oMU+ A6 21.10.2016 & §RT
A T G TE ) |

s I PRl B ST A B 9fhar e A H qof 21 81 Fal, gafoy siftfRM e

AT BT AT BT ST ATl BT G AGAT TP 23.11.2017 §RT fHA1 17 o1 | IWiaa At o

Judr a7 20.04.2018 TP T |

®.  TH® IWII TSI H Ulfeldl AMRT & I U ARG gE—giaemdl der SaavaHr qof
TRUTTPT &l & T DI UfhaAT AR PR <1 | {eT 982 DIl & UKIG 80 TIRUTTBIAT A
o< gJ ©, fOH 9 528 TR Y U T € |

Y. UM DI 15 DA TAT BRIGEIG DI 9 DA B 59 JfWAREH & 3F<id g
feeTep 06.12.2017 gIRT SrfeRgfera fobar |

9 919, IMRAgGd DIl & Yo & TR § FHRaA & 991 & X [ A8l bl o I, gAfey

AR H U R WU FRAd g AHI AW BT Rl a9 [ A 9y, STeRgEET faHld 19.04.2018

ERT 97T AT | I A & AR A= faAid 20.04.2019 TF I B |

F.  TE 98 TR E, THUM R BRISER B 17 i@, g TR FAHEE BT 343 i,
TRURYGT B 106 DIl AR TRUTMABIRA BT 181 DIANTIT BT 3 I Sfegad foar Tar
=

g @ 27.09.2018 B eI Yoo TR {7 T & |

I SMAFTIH B J&aT DI IR qUI Tb g BT [T 21.04.2016 ¥ 20.04.2020 T, TN ERT TRBR
BT UG a1 T &R A DI A || gRT srgEifed 1 fhar W, | =T BRIl & HIROT g9
JrferRgfera &l fohar S et |

21042019 | 20042020 @1 3@ & ARME, fOWRT 7 15 i @ JRRGAAN faid 18.06.2019,
10.09.2019, 17.01.2020 MG &I AR A= el o {1 IR fbar| Ifd, Foed o Afegfaa T8
frar < AT &, gty e &) Judr &1 fRAR HRAT MaTWF 7 |

SAD ATEl, IIHAE | TN 15 Dididl 8, e foly TR uiferarell | H=ifed v i gaT g,
72 il Saa AT & d8d SRy fhar o ', o foy W Saa srif-em & dudn &
favaTRa @R smaeda® 2 |

S @ BT | FERd G BRaE AUdT afy & ey & B S B, dfdhd a8 <@d ge fF
B DIl BT 3 T ARG 1 fbar ar 2, R afafm |4 Fide dg @l 9 aifde a5
T, gAfey Ufshar @ URT 9 & forg rffem @ aRT 4 # afdd wwy Srafy B qerr o 7| et
I8 AT © b 39 AfAFTH & ST 4(1) T 4(2) W weal AN WIS, BT UKl U A A I
fear S difs U A1 &l Dl ANTRS Gra—Jfaenall qoi SaeRemT qul TRufierd & "ifid R+ &
oI |1 |11 Ul HRATIT ST Wb AT 39 &A1 H Hord G TS B ST b |

afvar faw,
I R e 753, R |

FUSH [<3 3No Eﬁo ?1'36],
fedid 24 3FTRA, 2020. gt |

8876—H.V.S.—H.G.P. Pkl.



